CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF URBANCREST

PART THIRTEEN - BUILDING CODE

Chap.
1301. 
International Property Maintenance Code

Chap.
1305. 
Licensing of Contractors.

Chap.
1309.
Residential Code of Ohio.

Chap.
1313.
Permits and Fees.

CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF URBANCREST

PART THIRTEEN - BUILDING CODE

CHAPTER 1301

International Property Maintenance Code

1301.01
Adopted. 
1301.02
Revisions.

CROSS REFERENCES

Safety, sanitation and health generally - see GEN. OFF. Ch. 521

Duty to repair sidewalks - see GEN. OFF. 521.06

Littering - see GEN. OFF. 521.07

Weeds - see S.U. & P.S. Ch. 949

Junk vehicles - see P. & Z. 1175.02

1301.01
ADOPTED.

A certain document, which is on file in the office of the Fiscal Officer of the Village, being marked and designated as the International Property Maintenance Code of the Village of Urbancrest, in the State of Ohio, for the control of buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this chapter, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 1301.02 (Ord. 05-09. Passed 8-16-05.)

1301.02
REVISIONS.

The following sections are hereby revised:

(a)
Section 101.01. Title: These regulations shall be known as the “Property Maintenance Code of the Village of Urbancrest.”

(b)
Section 103.3. Deleted.

(c)
Section 103.6. Deleted.

(d)
Section 107 shall conform to Ohio Revised Code 715.26(B). All conflicting provisions of the Property Maintenance Code are hereby deleted.

(e)
Section 111. Appeals from decisions of the Code Official or a notice or order issued under the Property Maintenance Code shall be governed by Chapter 1107 of the Zoning Ordinance for the Village of Urbancrest.

(f)
Section 303.l4. Insert date: “Memorial Day to Labor Day”

(g)
Section 6023. Insert date: “January 1 through December 31”.

(h)
Section 602.4. Insert date: “January l through December 31".


(Ord. 05-09. Passed 8-16-05 .)

CHAPTER 1305

Licensing of Contractors

1305.01
License. 

1305.02
Bond required; conditions.

1305.99
Penalty.
CROSS REFERENCES

Power to license - see Ohio R.C. 715.27

1305.01
LICENSE.

(a)
Required. No person shall engage in work at the trade or occupation of plumber, general contractor, electrician, sewer tapper or heating and cooling contractor in the Village, until that person obtains a license in accordance with the provisions of these regulations. General contractors as used in this chapter means any person or firm engaged in the construction, alteration or addition of any structure which requires a building permit under the Ohio Building Code or the Ohio Residential Code. Homeowners who perform work on their own property with their own hands are not required to be licensed but must comply with all other procedures.

(b)
Issuance; Fee; License from Other Political Subdivision Required. The license required by one of these regulations shall be issued to an applicant by the Zoning Inspector upon payment by the applicant to the Village of a fee as provided in accordance with a schedule established by Council and upon presentation by the applicant of proof, satisfactory to the Zoning Inspector, of such applicant’s meeting requirements established by these regulations and any other regulations established by Council. All licenses issued by the Village shall expire on December 31 of the year in which it is issued.

(c)
Revocation of License. A license provided for in these regulations may, at any time, be revoked for incompetency, fraudulent use thereof or violation of the law of the State or the ordinances of the Village relative to building, after a full and fair hearing by the Zoning Inspector. After revocation for any of the causes aforesaid, no license shall be issued to the person whose license has been revoked until at least six months have elapsed.

(d)
Use of Fees. All money derived from the licensing of applicants shall be placed to the credit of the General Fund. (Ord. 01-29. Passed 9-20-01.)

1305.02
BOND REQUIRED; CONDITIONS.

All general contractors, plumbers, electricians, sewer tappers and heating and cooling contractors, licensed to perform their trade within the Village, as provided in these regulations, shall, prior to the issuance of such license, provide a bond in the penal sum of ten thousand dollars ($20,000), which bond shall provide that the licensee shall fully indemnify and save harmless the Village and any person or persons injured or damaged by the failure of such licensee to comply with the terms of any ordinance of the Village and with the terms of the laws of the State of Ohio. Such bond shall be in force from the date of its acceptance and the issuance of such license to the end of the year covered by such license, and the bond shall be renewed annually upon the re-issuance of such license. (Ord. 0l-29. Passed 9-20-01.)

1305.99
PENALTY.

Whoever violates or fails to comply with any provision of these regulations is guilty of a misdemeanor of the fourth degree. A separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or noncompliance occurs or continues.

(Ord. 01-29. Passed 9-20-01.)

CHAPTER 1309

Residential Code of Ohio

EDITOR’S NOTE: Ordinance 07-06 authorizes the Mayor and Fiscal Officer to enter into an agreement with Franklin County for the enforcement of the Residential Code of Ohio. There are no sections in Chapter 1309. It has been established as a place for cross references and future legislation.

CROSS REFERENCES

Adoption by references - see Ohio R.C. 731.231

Ohio Building Code applicable to other structures - see Ohio R.C. 3781.06

CHAPTER 1313

Permits and Fees

1313.01
Building and general fees. 

1313.02
Zoning fees. 

1313.03
Work started early and reinspection fees.
1313.04
Clean up bond procedures.

1313.01
BUILDING AND GENERAL FEES.
(a)
Plumber’s license: $50.00 for each calendar year;

(b)
General contractor’s license - $100.00 for each calendar year;

(c)
Electrician's license - $50.00 for each calendar year;

(d)
Sewer tapper’s license - $50.00 for each calendar year;

(e)
HV/AC contractor’s license - $50.00 for each calendar year;

(f)
Driveway permit - $30.00 each;

(g)
Sidewalk permit - $30.00 each;

(h)
Air conditioning permit - $30.00 each;

(i)
Sewer permit - $200.00 each;

(j)
Wrecking permit - $50.00 each, each permit application to be accompanied by a minimum $250.00 cash clean-up bond;

(k)
Sign permit - $40.00 each;
(l)
Fence permit - $20.00 each;

(m)
Heating permit - $30.00 each;

(n)
Tent permit - $100.00 each;

(o)
Excavation permit- $30.00 each.
(p)
Roofing - $25.00   Siding-$25.00  Window Openings-25.00  Door Openings-$25.00 Permits

(q)
Shed Permit-$25.00

(r)
Demolition Permit-$50.00 each, each permit application to be accompanied by a minimum $250.00 cash clean-up bond;
(s)
Decks-$25.00     Porch-$25.00    Steps-$25.00 Permits

(t)
Curb Cut Permit-$25.00


(Ord. 01-11. Passed 8-7-01.) (Amended Ord.15-05 Passed 02-03-15)
1313.02
ZONING FEES.

(a)
Zoning Permits.

(1)
Residential additions/accessory structures - $25.00 each;

(2)
New residential one family - $100.00 each;

(3)
New residential two family - $125.00 each;

(4)
New residential three family - $150.00 each;

(5)
Commercial additions/ accessory structures - $200.00 each;

(6)
New commercial - $100.00 each.


(Ord. 01-11. Passed 8-7-01.)

(b)
Variances. When application is filed for a Variance, a fee in accordance with the following shall be charged:

(1)
Single family dwelling ~ $200.00;

(2)
All others - $650.00.


(Ord. 01-35. Passed 11-6-01.)

(c)
Zoning Map Amendments. When an application is filed to rezone/amend the zoning map, a fee of $650.00 shall be rendered to the Fiscal Officer.

(Ord. 01-31. Passed 11-6-01.)
(d)
Conditional Uses. When an application is filed for a conditional use application, a fee in accordance with the following shall be charged:

(1)
Single-family dwelling - $200.00

(2)
All others - $650.00.


(Ord. 01-34. Passed 11-6-01.)
(e)
Compliance Review.


Fee

Conditional use permit 
$150.00

Variance permit 
$250.00

(Ord. 01-32. Passed 11-6-01.)
(f)
Appeals. When an appeal is filed with the Board of Zoning Appeals, fee charged shall be in accordance with the following:

(1)
Appeal of cease and desist order, single-family dwelling: $100.00.

(2)
All others: $650.00.


(Ord. 01-33. Passed 11-6-01.)
(g)
Wireless Telecommunication Facilities. Wireless telecommunication facilities must hereby pay a license fee of $10,000 for antennas 1-4, and an additional $1,500 for each antenna in excess of 4. (Ord. 01-30. Passed 9-20-01.)

1313.03
WORK STARTED EARLY AND REINSPECTION FEES.

(a)
The above fees for permit and licenses shall be tripled if any Work is commenced before an application for such permit of license has been filed with the Fiscal Officer or Zoning Inspector. Such triple fee shall not apply to any emergency or urgently necessary Work if a permit for such work is obtained as provided.
(b)
Reinspection fees may be charged Whenever an additional inspection is necessary due to: faulty or incomplete construction; improper address; locked premises; or any other reason beyond the control of the Zoning Inspector. The reinspection fee per trip shall be $30.00 payable in advance. (Ord. 01-11. Passed 8-7-01.)
1313.04
CLEAN-UP BOND PROCEDURES.

(a)
The clean-up bond will be assessed in conjunction with the wrecking permit issued pursuant to Section 1313.01.

(b)
The clean-up bond will be deposited into a holding account designated by the Fiscal Officer until all construction is complete.

(c)
Upon completion of the project the entity shall contact the Village Zoning Officer to inspect the completed project to ensure that all Zoning requirements and all obligations have been met.

(d)
Once the Zoning Officer has certified that all requirements and obligations have been met the Zoning Officer shall make arrangements with the Fiscal Officer for the clean-up bond to be remitted to the individual.

(e)
If the Zoning Officer renders that the requirements and obligations have not been met, the Zoning Officer and Street Commissioner shall make sure no damage is done to the easement or street or anything else under their supervision and shall enforce the necessary provisions as established by the Zoning Code.

(Ord. 07-08. Passed 8-7-07.)
